
CONTRACT # 22-11: DUST CONTROL
OCTOBER 31, 2022 @ 1:30 P.M.
TABULATION

Specific % % % ICRD gravel rds. MDOT shoulders
Bidder Name Percent Type Gravity Calcium Magnesium Sodium Price per gal. Price per gal. Terms

SM Liquid Tire Fill 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID Net 30.  *Small truck load spread are $0.20/gal. 8,000 gal

26% Mineral well brine 1.25 16.61% 3.33% 2.54% $0.16* NO BID min. load continus spread. $85/hr over 1.5 hours per load.

Corrigan Environmental 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID Net 30

Solutions 26% Dustmaster 20 1.23 18.3 5.9 5.6 19.25 cents $0.38

Michigan Tanker 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID Net 15

26% Mineral Well brine 1.275 23.1 3.73 3.83 $0.20 $0.20

Great Lakes Chloride 38% Processed 1.392 38 +/- 0 .05+/- $0.739 $0.669 * Net 30.  * MDOT, $125/ hr Port to Port , 7,000 gal. minimum

26% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID

Wilkinson Solutions 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID Net 30

26% Mineral Well brine 1.25 - 1.28 19 - 20 4.5 4 19 cents $0.30

Michigan Chloride Sales 38% N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID Net 30.  Pricing only fo Berlin, Lyons,North Plains, Odessa and

26% Mineral Well brine 1.24 - 1.28 18 - 22 3 - 4 5 - 6 $0.220 NO BID  Orange. Pricing based on 9,500 gal. loads sizes

Board action 12/06/22:
The Board approved the recommendation of award for 2023 Dust Control to Wilkinson Solutions for all county roads and to Michigan Tanker for MDOT shoulders,
pending MDOT approval.

Board action 02/21/23:
The Board approved the recommendation of award for 2023 Dust Control to Corrigan Environmental Solutions at $0.1925 per gallon for all county roads, due to Wilkinson Solutions
having withdrawn their bid.


