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SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, MAY 3, 2024 @ 2:00 PM TABULATION lonia County Road Commission
Dornbos Sign Inc. Michigan St Indust Osburn Associates MD Solutions
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2

3 |SIGNS DESCRIPTION Charlotte, M| Lansing, Ml Logan, OH Plein City, OH

4 |36" STOP HIP New $44.28 $43.65 $50.57 $53.82
5 HIP Refurb No bid $36.00 No bid No bid

6 Aluminum Blank $30.35 $28.53 $30.53 $32.67
7 |36" STOP AHEAD HIP New $49.69 $52.65 $52.92 $53.82
8 HIP Refurb No bid $40.50 No bid No bid

9 Aluminum Blank $30.35 $28.53 $31.95 $32.67
10 |36" YIELD HIP New $22.14 $21.83 $26.46 $28.00
11 HIP Refurb No bid $18.00 No bid No bid

12 Aluminum Blank $15.18 $14.27 $15.98 $19.00
13 130" STOP HIP New $30.75 $30.31 $35.00 $36.00
14 HIP Refurb No bid $25.00 No bid No bid

15 Aluminum Blank $21.08 $19.81 $21.30 $22.69
16 |30" STOP AHEAD HIP New $34.23 $36.56 $36.75 $37.38
17 HIP Refurb No bid $40.50 No bid No bid

18 Aluminum Blank $21.08 $19.81 $22.19 $22.69
19 |30X30 WARNING HIP New $30.75 $30.31 $36.75 $37.38
20 HIP Refurb No bid $25.00 No bid No bid

21 Aluminum Blank $21.08 $19.81 $22.19 $22.69
22 [36X36 WARNING HIP New $44.28 $43.65 $52.92 $53.82
23 HIP Refurb No bid $36.00 No bid No bid

24 Aluminum Blank $30.35 $28.53 $31.95 $32.67
25 |18X18 WARNING HIP New $11.07 $10.91 $13.23 $13.46
26 HIP Refurb No bid $9.00 No bid No bid

27 Aluminum Blank $8.09 $7.13 $7.99 $8.16
28 |24X18 WARNING HIP New $14.76 $14.55 $17.64 $17.94
29 HIP Refurb No bid $12.00 No bid No bid

30 Aluminum Blank $10.12 $9.51 $10.65 $10.89
31 [24X24 WARNING HIP New $19.68 $19.40 $23.52 $23.92
32 HIP Refurb No bid $16.00 No bid No bid

33 Aluminum Blank $13.49 $12.68 $14.20 $14.52
34 |48X24 WARNING HIP New $39.36 $38.80 $47.04 $47.84
35 HIP Refurb No bid $32.00 No bid No bid

36 Aluminum Blank $26.98 $25.36 $28.40 $29.09
37 [12X18 REGULATORY |HIP New $7.58 $7.28 $8.82 $8.97
38 HIP Refurb No bid $6.00 No bid No bid

39 Aluminum Blank $6.06 $4.76 $5.33 $5.45
40 |12X24 REGULATORY [HIP New $9.84 $9.70 $11.76 $11.96
41 HIP Refurb No bid $8.00 No bid No bid

42 Aluminum Blank $7.49 $6.34 $7.10 $7.26
43 |24X30 REGULATORY [HIP New $24.60 24.25 $29.40 29.9

44 HIP Refurb No bid $20.00 No bid No bid

45 Aluminum Blank $16.86 $15.85 $17.75 $18.15
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46
47 |SIGNS DESCRIPTION Dornbos Sign Inc. Michigan St Indust Osburn Associates MD Solutions
48 |30X30 REGULATORY |[HIP New $30.75 $30.31 $36.75 $37.38
49 HIP Refurb No bid $25.00 No bid No bid
50 Aluminum Blank $21.08 $19.81 $22.19 $22.69
51 130X36 REGULATORY |HIP New $36.90 $38.38 $44.10 $44.85
52 HIP Refurb No bid $30.00 No bid No bid
53 Aluminum Blank $25.29 $23.78 26.63 $32.67
54 REFLECTIVE POST PANELS 3'X72"
55 Red|New $9.01 $7.28 8.82 $9.00
56 Refurb No bid No bid No bid No bid
57 Amber|New $9.01 $7.28 8.82 $9.00
58 Refurb No bid No bid No bid No bid
59 White[New $9.01 $7.28 8.82 $9.00
60 Refurb No bid No bid No bid No bid
61 REFL ROLLED GOODS 36"x50 yards
62 Black $630.00 $405.00 $557.30 $700.00
63 Colored $737.10 $445.50 $544.50 $645.00
64 STREET SIGN EXTRUDED/FLAT PANEL HIP
65 New 9x18" $6.25 $6.58 $6.59 $9.00
66 9 x24" $8.04 $8.78 $8.82 $12.00
67 9x30" $10.07 $10.97 $11.03 $15.00
68 9x36" $12.05 $13.16 $13.23 $18.00
69 9x42" $14.09 $15.39 $15.41 $21.00
70 9x 48" $16.07 $17.55 $17.64 $24.00
71 Refurbished 9x18" No bid $5.06 No bid No bid
72 9 x24" No bid $6.75 No bid No bid
73 9x30" No bid $8.44 No bid No bid
74 9x36" No bid $10.13 No bid No bid
75 9x42" No bid $11.81 No bid No bid
76 9x48" No bid $13.50 No bid No bid
77 48X9 RR CROSS BUCKS $83.46 No bid No bid $55.00
78 4x8 HIP rectangular panel (ea) $1.96 No bid $1.40 $3.00
79 7' painted steel delineator post (ea) $11.74 No bid No bid $8.37
80 Galvanized sign backing plate (ea) $0.85 No bid No bid $1.25
81 12 ga. Square tubing 3' length (ea) $39.50 No bid No bid $30.00
82 3# GALVANIZED SIGN POST U-CHANNEL
83 10" $42.45 No bid No bid $36.30
84 12" $50.94 No bid No bid $43.56
85 14" $59.43 No bid No bid $50.82
86 16" $67.92 No bid No bid $58.08
87| Sign Backing Plates $0.85 No bid No bid $1.90
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Terms / Comments:

Alum blanks are refurbished
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