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AWARDS 
2023 SEASONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR MATERIALS 

Effective March 1, 2023 through February 29, 2024 

 
 
On February 14, 2023, at the regular meeting of the Board of Commissioners for Ionia County, regarding 
2023  Seasonal  Requirements  for Materials,  the  Board  authorized management  to  purchase  from  the 
lowest responsive bidders, as recommended, in the best interest of the Road Commission for the following 
items: 

 
GRADER & SNOW PLOW BLADES 
St. Regis Culvert, lowest responsive bidder. 
 
BITUMINOUS MIX             

  Lakeland Asphalt, lowest responsive bidder. 
 
  STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & POSTS         
  Action Traffic Maintenance, lowest responsive bidder. 
   
  GEOTEXTILE SILT FENCE        

Ferguson Waterworks for straw blanket and 6” wire staples. 
CSI Geoturf for silt fence. 

 
 

 
On February 14, 2023, at the regular meeting of the Board of Commissioners for Ionia County, regarding 
2023 Seasonal Requirements for Materials, the Board authorized management to reject all bids for the 
following items, acting in the best interest of the Road Commission: 
 
METAL CULVERTS 
 
PLASTIC PIPE 
 
SIGNS 
 
DIESEL FUEL 
 
MISCELLANEOUS HARDWARE 
 
 
 

  



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

METAL CULVERTS

DIAMETER Jensen Bridge St. Regis Culvert
INCHES MM GAUGE PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT

12 300 16 $9.00 $8.50

15 375 16 $10.80 $10.20

18 450 16 $13.50 $12.75

24 600 16 $18.00 $16.15

30 750 14 $26.35 $25.50

36 900 14 $32.28 $30.60

42 1050 14 $39.62 $35.70

48 1200 14 $45.45 $40.80

2' (600 mm) wide band / ea 2x per ft of pipe 2x per foot price

TERMS / COMMENTS 1% 10 net 30. Net 30 days or 1% net 10
Pricing good for 60 days days. Prices firm 30 days
No delivery charge or from bid date. Minimum
minimum order to include freight is

$5,500, less than said 
amount add $150.00



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

PLASTIC PIPE

M292 Type S Smooth Int. *Single Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Single Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Single Wall Corr.
DIAMETER PRICE PER DIAMETER PRICE PER DIAMETER PRICE PER DIAMETER PRICE PER DIAMETER PRICE PER DIAMETER PRICE PER

INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT

4 $1.22 4 $0.49 4 4 4 4

6 $2.11 6 $1.20 6 6 6 6

8 $3.77 8 $2.30 8 8 8 8

10 $5.34 10 $3.70 10 10 10 10

12 $6.39 12 $4.90 12 12 12 12

15 $8.17 15 $8.85 15 15 15 15

18 $12.38 18 $12.25 18 18 18 18

24 $19.91 24 n/a 24 24 24 24

30 $30.41 30 n/a 30 30 30 30

36 $39.01 36 n/a 36 36 36 36

42 $50.92 42 n/a 42 42 42 42

48 $62.42 48 n/a 48 48 48 48

60 $93.41 60 n/a 60 60 60 60
Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments:
Net 30 days. Minimum 1/2 truckload

VanderVelde Sales & Service



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

BLADES

Single bevel curved

Priced per 40,000 # truckload

5/8" x 6" any length Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot*

Delivery time
5/8" x 8"  any length Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot**

Delivery time

3/4" x 8"  any length Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot

Delivery time

Terms / Comments: Minimum order $6,500 *Vallite through hardened
any combination of Prices firm 30 days from
blade sizes/types. bid date, after said time
Average lead time is 50 prices subject to change
days to ship, subject to without notice.
material availability.

$24.98

$34.75

90 days

90 days

Wear Parts/Equip St. Regis Culvert

$18.36 $15.50
50 days

50 days

50 days 90 days

$19.80

$21.95 *



SEASONAL BIDS ‐ MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION

Ionia County Road Commission

SIGNS DESCRIPTION Osburn Associates

36" STOP HIP New $50.57

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $30.53
36" STOP AHEAD HIP New $52.92

HIP Refurb NO BID
Aluminum Blank $31.95

36" YIELD HIP New $26.50

HIP Refurb NO BID
Aluminum Blank $15.98

30" STOP HIP New $35.28
HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $21.30

30" STOP AHEAD HIP New $36.75

HIP Refurb NO BID
Aluminum Blank $22.19

30X30 WARNING HIP New $36.75

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $22.19
36X36 WARNING HIP New $52.92

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $31.95
18X18 WARNING HIP New $13.23

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $7.99

24X18 WARNING HIP New $17.64

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $10.65

24X24 WARNING HIP New $23.52

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $14.20

48X24 WARNING HIP New $47.04

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $28.40

12X18 REGULATORY HIP New $8.82

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $5.33
12x24  REGULATORY HIP New $11.76

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $7.10



SIGNS DESCRIPTION Osburn Associates
24x30 REGULATORY HIP New $29.40

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $17.75

30X30 REGULATORY HIP New $36.75

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $22.19

30X36 REGULATORY HIP New $44.10

HIP Refurb NO BID

Aluminum Blank $26.65

Black $481.50

Colored $544.50

NEW New/Refurb New/Refurb New/Refurb New/Refurb New/Refurb

9x18" $6.08

9x24" $8.15

9x30" $10.18

9x36" $12.22

9x42" $14.23

9x48" $16.29

NO BID

$1.30

NO BID

$1.10

NO BID

3# Galvanized sign post U‐channel

10' NO BID

12' NO BID

14' NO BID

16' NO BID

Terms/Comments:

REFL ROLLED GOODS 36"x50 yards

12 ga.  Square tubing 3' length (ea)

Galvanized sign backing plate (ea)

7' painted steel delineator post (ea)

4x8 HIP rectangular panel (ea)

STREET SIGN EXTRUDED/FLAT PANEL HIP

48X9 RR CROSS BUCKS



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

BITUMINOUS MIX
PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON

BIDDER TYPE AT PLANT DELIVERED (50 TON MIN) TERMS / COMMENTS
Lakeland Asphalt Corp BMP-7 (cold patch) $110.00 $118.50 Terms - Net 30 days
Battle Creek, MI

BIDDER
Ajax Materials Corporation UPM $125.00 $145.25 Net 30 days upon receipt of invoice
Troy, MI

BIDDER
Michigan Paving & Materials LVSP $75.00 $210/hour * *Subject to additional fuel surcharge
Jackson, MI MEL $78.00 $210/hour * *Subject to additional fuel surcharge

SEL $78.00 $210/hour * *Subject to additional fuel surcharge
Terms - Net 30 days

BIDDER
Capital Asphalt LLC UPM cold patch $165.00 $175.00
Lansing, MI MDOT 36-A $74.20 n/a

MDOT-13-A $71.95 n/a



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & POSTS

Action Traffic Maint Jensen Bridge Nationwide Construct
STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each

6' 3" TRANSITIONS W BEAM TO THRIE BEAM $250.00 $267.00 $200.00
12' 6" PANELS THRIE BEAM $215.00 $215.00 $250.00
12' 6" PANELS TYPE B STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL $130.00 $105.00 $150.00
SRT BUFFERED ENDS $75.00 $85.00 $90.00
SRT (EA) $2,800.00 $3,500.00 $3,000.00
FLEAT (EA) $2,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,000.00
FLEAT HEAD (EA) $865.00 $900.00 $1,200.00
FLEAT CABLE KIT (EA) $215.00 $200.00 $325.00
SKT 350 (EA) $3,200.00 $3,700.00 $3,300.00
SKT HEAD (EA) $1,025.00 $1,100.00 $1,500.00
X-LITE 50 (EA) n/a n/a n/a
TREATED WOOD GUARDRAIL POSTS
45" BREAKAWAY (EA) $52.00 $55.00 $95.00
6' SOLID (EA) $81.00 $84.00 $150.00
6'  CRT (EA) $81.00 $85.00 $120.00
7' (EA) $88.00 $98.00 $130.00
8' (EA) please inquire $112.00 $250.00
STEEL GUARDRAIL POSTS

6' (EA) $68.00 $71.00 $110.00
7' (EA) $79.00 $82.00 $120.00
8' (EA) $87.00 $99.00 $140.00

Terms / Comments: Pricing good for 180 days $5,000 minimum
from date of bid. order required.



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

GEOTEXTILE SILT FENCE

ALTERNATE PRICE UNIT ALTERNATE PRICE UNIT

MIRAFI 3' X 100' @ 6' SPACING ACF3036751MI $0.42 LFT. MDOT $0.395 LFT.

MIRAFI 3' X 100' @ 7' 7" SPACING no bid LFT. no bid LFT.

MIRAFI 2' X 100' @ 7' 7" SPACING no bid LFT. Geoturf 24-6 2'x100' $0.31 LFT.

MULCH BLANKET 6.5' X 83.5' no bid SYD. regular straw 8'x112' $0.34 SYD.

OTHER MULCH BLANKET Double net straw 8'x112' $0.32 SYD. MB High velocity 8'x112' $0.42 SYD.

SYD. Geoturf N800 for plain riprap $1.40 SYD.

SYD. Geoturf N1000E for heavy riprap $1.90 SYD.

6" WIRE STAPLES (PER 1000) $42.00 $62.00

8" WOOD PEGS (PER 1000) 6" wood pegs $96.00 $112.00
TERMS / COMMENTS: Net 10th prox. Manufacturer warranty

applies. Lead times are subject to
manufacturer production and availability

Ferguson Waterworks CSI Geoturf



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

DIESEL

ULTRA Crystal Flash Inc. Petroleum Traders Corp
LOW SULFUR

WINTER BLEND Grand Rapids, MI Fort Wayne, IN
Freight $0.0798 $0.0697

Cents per gal over OPIS $0.0000 -$0.0188
Total Price per Gallon $0.0798 $0.0509

REGULAR

LOW SULFUR

SUMMER BLEND

Freight $0.0498 $0.0697
Cents per gal over OPIS $0.0000 -$0.0388
Total Price per Gallon $0.0498 $0.0309

Price Held/Not Held Not held Not held
Notes: Terms- Net 10 days Net 30, no discount

Will bill the Federal LUST
(0.0010), State Environmental
Fee (0.0100), FED Oil Spill
(0.00214), and the Federal
SuperFund (0.0039) as
separate line items on invoices



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - MONDAY, FEB 6, 2023 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

NUTS, BOLTS, MISC. HARDWARE
Marshall Sales Inc. West

Price per Delivery Price per Delivery
Quantity Time Quantity Time

2000 5/8 - 11 x 2 1/2 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT $1.0900 stock $1,489.60 7-10 business days
2000 5/8 - 11 X 2 3/4 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT POA $1,933.29 7-10 business days
2000 5/8 - 11 X 2 1/4 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT $1.0000 stock $1,353.81 7-10 business days
2000 5/8 HEAVY SPLIT LOCK WASHER $0.1370 stock $276.64 7-10 business days
2000 5/8 - 11 HEAVY HEX NUT 2 HARD $0.6329 stock $428.26 7-10 business days
100 3/8 - 16 X 1 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $0.2543 stock $17.42 7-10 business days
100 1/2 - 13 X 2 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $0.7985 stock $42.43 7-10 business days
100 1/4 - 20 X 1 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $0.1278 stock $11.44 7-10 business days
100 3/8 FLAT WASHERS HEAVY DUTY $0.1125 stock $3.46 7-10 business days
100 1/2 FLAT WASHERS HEAVY DUTY $0.1942 stock $12.37 7-10 business days
100 1/2 FLAT FENDER WASHERS $0.1136 stock $15.69 7-10 business days
100 3/16 X 12" PLASTIC TIE WRAPS $0.0662 stock $3.76 7-10 business days
100' 12 X 2 GAUGE ELECTRICAL WIRE $129.10 3-4 days $85.52 7-10 business days
100' 12 GAUGE ELECTRICAL WIRE $47.10 3-4 days $40.17 7-10 business days

TERMS / COMMENTS Net 30 Minimum $50 orders. Grade 8
Several items identified quoted for lock washer, nuts, screws
as "not made in USA" or and washers.
"made in Canada"

Kalamazoo, MI Ramsey, NJ
Wurth USA
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