ROAD COMMISSION FOR IONIA COUNTY

170 E. Riverside Drive o P.O.Box 76 e lonia, Michigan 48846 e Phone (616) 527-1700 ¢ Fax (616) 527-8848

HERBERT C. CUSACK
Commissioner

EARL S. STRATER FREDERICK A. CHAPMAN DOROTHY G. POHL, CPA WAYNE A. SCHOONOVER, P.E.
Commissioner Commissioner Managing Director County Highway Engineer

AWARDS

2010 SEASONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR MATERIALS

ON FEBRUARY 17, 2010, AT THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD OF ROAD
COMMISSIONERS FOR IONIA COUNTY, REGARDING 2010 SEASONAL REQUIREMENTS
FOR MATERIALS, THE BOARD AUTHORIZED MANAGEMENT TO PURCHASE FROM THE
LOWEST RESPONSIVE BIDDERS, AS RECOMMENDED, IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE
ROAD COMMISSION FOR THE FOLLOWING ITEMS:

ITEM I

ITEMII

ITEM Il

ITEM IV

ITEMV

ITEM VI

ITEM VIII

ITEM IX

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE
Premarc, lowest responsive bidder on all but one item

PLASTIC PIPE
Lowest responsive bidder, providing material is compatible with existing inventory

BLADES
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed

SIGNS
Dornbos Sign Inc., due to ability to supply orders within required 30 day time period

BITUMINOUS MIX
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed

STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & STEEL POSTS
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed

GEOTEXTILE SILT FENCE
Lowest responsive bidder, as needed

DIESEL
Lemmen Oil, lowest responsive bidder for added “freight” price plus “% over rack price”



SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION

ITEM I

CULVERTS

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
DIAMETER Contech Jensen Bridge Premarc St. Regis

INCHES | MM | GAUGE PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT PRICE / FOOT
12 300 16 $6.35 $5.31 $4.97 $5.20
15 375 16 $7.62 $6.58 $6.04 $6.40
18 450 16 $9.53 $8.20 $7.91 $8.10
24 600 16 $12.07 $10.64 $10.34 $10.30
30 750 14 $19.05 $17.20 $13.10 $15.60
36 900 14 $22.86 $21.14 $18.50 $18.72
42| 1050 14 $36.20 $24.82 $21.52 $21.85
48| 1200 14 $40.45 $28.59 $24.42 $28.36

2' (600 mm) wide band / ea|2 x price of pipe 2 times per ft of pipe [same as 2' of pipe 2 x per foot price

TERMS / COMMENTS|1/2% 10 days 1% 10 days 1% 10, net 30 Net 30 days

Firm for 120 days

Net 30 days

Prices will remain
firm for 90 days.
After 90 days, prices
will be reviewed for
possible increase or
decrease relative to
current steel market
conditions.

Prices will remain firm
for 90 days.

Prices firm 90 days
from bid date.

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Scott Peterson at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION

ITEM II
PLASTIC PIPE

Bidder:
Haviland Drainage Products

Bidder:

ADS

Bidder:
St. Regis Culvert

M292 Type S Smooth Int. Single Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Single Wall Corr. M292 Type S Smooth Int. Single Wall Corr.
DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER |PRICE PER|DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER |PRICE PER|DIAMETER | PRICE PER | DIAMETER | PRICE PER
INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT INCHES FOOT
4 $0.61 4 $0.24 4 $0.53 4 $0.25 4 No bid 4]  No bid
6 $1.50 6 $0.68 6 $1.35 6 $0.61 6 No bid 6/ No bid
8 $2.31 8 $1.23 8 $2.25 8 $1.20 8 No bid 8] No bid
10 $2.91 10 $2.20 10 $3.25 10 $1.90 10 No bid 10| No bid
12 $3.58 12 $2.79 12 $3.64 12 $2.47 12 $4.12 12| No bid
15 $5.00 15 $4.45 15 $5.05 15 $4.25 15 $5.00 15| No bid
18 $7.40 18 $7.52 18 $7.50 18 $6.70 18 $8.00 18| No bid
24 $11.88 24 $12.18 24 $12.00 24 $10.15 24 $13.20 24|  No bid
30 $18.80 30| No bid 30 $19.00 30| No bid 30 No bid 30| No bid
36 $21.75 36|/ No bid 36 $22.00 36|/ No bid 36 No bid 36|/ No bid
42 $31.67 42  No bid 42 $32.00 42  No bid 42 No bid 42  No bid
48 $35.64 48[ No bid 48 $36.00 48[ No bid 48 No bid 48[ No bid
54 No bid 54|  No bid 54 No bid 54|  No bid 54 No bid 54| No bid
60 $66.33 60| No bid 60 $61.00 60| No bid 60 No bid 60| No bid
66 No bid 66| No bid 66 No bid 66| No bid 66 No bid 66| No bid
72 No bid 72| No bid 72 No bid 72| No bid 72 No bid 72| No bid
Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments: Terms / Comments:
Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 days

Minimum load size: load must be at least 1/4 of a
load for delivery.

Prices firm 30 days from bid date

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Scott Peterson, Road Superintendent at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION

ITEM I
BLADES

Single bevel curved
Priced per 40,000 # truckload

Bidder:
Winter Equipment

Bidder:
St. Regis Culvert

Bidder:

Shults Equipment

Bidder:
Truck & Trailer

5/8" x 6" any length

Price per foot

Price per foot

Price per foot

Price per foot

$8.06 $8.80 $7.56 $7.56
Delivery time 21 days ARO 35-45 days ARO 45 days ARO 45 - 60
5/8" x 8" any length Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot
$11.37 $11.49 $10.63 $10.63
Delivery time 21 days ARO 35-45 days ARO 45 days ARO 45 - 60
3/4" x 8" any length Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot Price per foot
$15.82 $12.85 $16.80 $16.80
Delivery time 21 days ARO 35-45 days ARO 45 days ARO 45 - 60
Terms / Comments: |Pricing firm for 60 days |Net 30 days Prices firm until Net 30 days

5/8" blades quoting
double bevel mat'l

3/4" blades quoting
thru hardened mat'l

Prices firm 30 days
from bid date

March 10, 2010.

Prices based on a full
42,000 Ib. shipment

5/8" blades bid carbon.
Prices include freight
based on 42,000 |b
truck load.

Price is valid for 30 days
after bid date.
Alternate bid:
3/4"x8"x72" double
bevel curved, thru
hardened $13.14

per foot.

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Don Chubb, Fleet Manager at 616-527-1700 x 118 or don@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M

TABULATION
ITEM IV Page 1 of 2
SIGNS DESCRIPTION Dornbos Sign Inc. Rocal Inc.
36" STOP HIP Grade $33.26 $36.18
Diamond Grade $64.50 $56.34
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $16.68 $16.29
36" STOP AHEAD HIP Grade $41.33 $39.69
Diamond Grade $85.65 $6.65
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $20.50 $19.80
36" YIELD HIP Grade $18.36 $17.67
Diamond Grade $33.99 $26.40
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $8.27 $7.45
30" STOP HIP Grade $23.09 $25.13
Diamond Grade $44.79 $39.13
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $11.50 $11.31
30" STOP AHEAD HIP Grade $28.77 $28.63
Diamond Grade $59.64 $42.63
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $14.25 $14.81
12X18 REGULATORY HIP Blank $6.00 $5.85
HIP Grade $6.69 $6.03
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $3.75 $2.72
24X30 REGULATORY HIP Blank $19.40 $19.50
HIP Grade $20.40 $20.10
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $9.88 $9.05
30X30 REGULATORY HIP Blank $24.25 $24.38
HIP Grade $25.50 $25.13
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $12.35 $11.31
30X36 REGULATORY HIP Blank $29.10 $29.25
HIP Grade $30.60 $30.15
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $13.79 $13.58
30X48 REGULATORY HIP Blank $38.80 $39.00
HIP Grade $40.80 $40.20
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $20.10 $18.10
18X18 WARNING HIP Blank $8.73 $8.78
HIP Grade $9.18 $9.05
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $4.52 $4.07
24X18 WARNING HIP Blank $11.64 $11.70
HIP Grade $12.24 $12.06
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $6.03 $5.43




ITEM IV continued Page 2 of 2
SIGNS DESCRIPTION Dornbos Sign Inc. Rocal Inc.
24X24 WARNING HIP Blank $15.52 $15.60
HIP Grade $16.32 $16.08
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $8.04 $7.24
48X24 WARNING HIP Blank $31.00 $31.20
HIP Grade $32.64 $32.16
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $16.08 $14.48
30X30 WARNING HIP Blank $24.25 $24.38
HIP Grade $25.50 $25.13
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $12.56 $11.31
36X36 WARNING HIP Blank $34.90 $35.10
HIP Grade $36.72 $36.18
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: |Face HIP Grade $18.09 $16.29
36X36 RR WARNING HIP Blank $39.90 $35.10
HIP Grade $36.72 $36.18
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: [Face HIP Grade $18.09 $16.29
48X9 RR CROSS BUCKS|HIP Blank $30.00 $23.40
HIP Grade * $75.50 $24.12
Scotchlite Refl Sheeting: [Face HIP Grade $6.50 $10.86
REFL ROLLED GOODS 36"x50 yards
Black $518.00 $652.05
Colored $750.00 $652.05
STREET SIGN EXTRUDED HIP Blank w/ Rd Name Blank w/ Rd Name
24x9 $14.05 $19.80 $10.80 $22.80
30x9 $16.43 $23.54 $13.50 $25.50
36x9 $20.83 $28.50 $16.20 $28.20
48x9 $25.94 $34.50 $21.60 $33.60
STREET SIGN FLAT PANEL-FACE HIP Blank w/ Rd Name Blank w/ Rd Name
24x9 $7.09 $9.53 $9.36 $21.12
30x9 $8.88 $11.95 $11.70 $23.40
36x9 $10.50 $14.28 $14.04 $25.68
48x9 $14.15 $19.06 $18.72 $30.24
12" extruded sign bracket (ea) $12.53 No Bid
Galvanized sign backing plate (ea) $0.40 No Bid
7' painted steel delineator post (ea) $5.79 No Bid
4x8 HIP rectangular panel (ea) $3.95 No Bid
12 ga. Tubing 1.25" square (per ft) $2.88 No Bid

Terms / Comments:

*48x9 RR Cross buck
HIP Grade $37.75

per piece

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Jim Dutcher at 616-527-1700 x 122 or jimd@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M

TABULATION
ITEMV
BITUMINOUS MIX

PRICE PER TON

PRICE PER TON

BIDDER TYPE AT PLANT DELIVERED (50 TON MIN) TERMS / COMMENTS
Saginaw Asphalt Paving Co. |CP-6 $78.00 $81.09|Net 30 days
QPR $78.00 $85.38|50 ton loads
BIDDER
Rieth-Riley Construction Co. |HMA-13A base/top $51.00 No bid Net 30 days
HMA-36A top $53.00 No bid
HMA-3C base $50.00 No bid
HMA-4C top $53.25 No bid
Cold patch Bonox - CP-7 $115.00 $120.00
BIDDER
Michigan Paving & Materials [13A MDOT $55.46 $65.46|Net 30 days
36A MDOT $61.62 $71.62
3C MDOT $59.33 $69.33
4C MDOT $60.34 $70.34
BIDDER
Ajax Materials Corporation SPM $82.00 $92.00|Net 30 days upon receipt of invoice
UPM $90.00 $102.00
BIDDER
Superior Asphalt Inc. 13A plant produced HMA $51.40 No bid Net 30
36A plant produced HMA $57.00 No bid
3C plant produced HMA $52.50 No bid
4C plant produced HMA $53.50 No bid
Hot winter mix $110.00 N/A

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Scott Peterson, Road Superintendent at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION

ITEM VI
STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL & POSTS

Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder
TAPCO Jensen Bridge Nationwide Constr. Hwy. Improvement J & J Contracting
STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price Each
6' 3" TRANSITIONS W BEAM TO THRIE BEAM No Bid $89.71 $88.00 $95.00 $82.00
12' 6" PANELS THRIE BEAM No Bid $211.32 $108.00 $109.00 $97.50
12' 6" PANELS TYPE B STEEL BEAM GUARDRAIL No Bid $89.71 $70.00 $66.50 $66.50
98" BUFFERED ENDS No Bid $53.50 $35.00 $68.00 $56.50
SRT (EA) No Bid $2,607.52 $1,565.00 $1,775.00 $1,425.00
FLEAT (EA) No Bid $2,473.15 $1,680.00 $1,495.00 $1,440.00
SKT 350 (EA) No Bid $3,343.65 $2,350.00 $1,975.00 $1,805.00
ET (EA) No Bid $3,276.11 $2,185.00 $2,275.00 $1,905.00
TREATED WOOD GUARDRAIL POSTS
6' (EA) No Bid $44.73 $36.00 $29.75 $28.50
7' (EA) No Bid $52.18 $42.00 $34.00 $33.25
8' (EA) No Bid N/A $48.00 $38.25 $37.50
STEEL GUARDRAIL POSTS
6' (EA) No Bid $50.32 $44.00 $38.00 $34.95
7' (EA) No Bid $60.37 $54.00 $44.00 $42.95
8' (EA) No Bid $67.09 $62.00 $50.00 $47.95
Terms / Comments: 1% 10 days, Net 30  |Net 30 days Net 30 Net 30

Prices will remain
firm for 90 days.
After 90 days prices
will be reviewed for
possible increase or
decrease due to
relative current steel
market conditions.

Minimum $15,000
order

Orders to be $3500
or more for delivery.

2% discount for
customer pick up

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Scott Peterson, Road Superintendent at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION

ITEM VIII
GEOTEXTILE SILT FENCE

BIDDER: BIDDER: BIDDER:
Jensen Bridge & Supply ECO-SISS CSI Geoturf
ALTERNATE | PRICE UNIT ALTERNATE | PRICE UNIT ALTERNATE PRICE UNIT
MIRAFI 3' X 100' @ 6' SPACING Jensen $0.27 LFT. Propex $0.28 LFT. MDOT 6.25' $0.28 LFT.
MIRAFI 3' X 100' @ 7' 7" SPACING |Jensen $0.24| LFT. [Propex $0.24] LFT. [10' spacing $0.24| LFT.
MIRAFI 2' X 100" @ 7' 7" SPACING |Jensen $0.15| LFT. [Propex $0.18] LFT. [10' spacing $0.15| LFT.
MULCH BLANKET 6.5' X 83.5' 6'8"x108' straw $0.61| SYD. |Regular8x112' $0.30f SYD. |Regular6.5x138.5 $0.28( SYD.
OTHER MULCH BLANKET 2x100 @ 6.25' sp $0.23[ SYD.
Mirafi 500X $0.75| SYD. |Hivelocity 8'x112' $0.32|] SYD. [Hivelocity 8x112.5 $0.33] SYD.
Mirafi 140N $0.82| SYD. [Propex 401ST $0.49] SYD. [Geoturf N80O $0.73] SYD.
Propex 801ST $0.78] SYD. [Geoturf N1OOOE $1.09] SYD.
Geoturf N400 $0.48| SYD.
6" WIRE STAPLES (PER 1000) $44.78 $28.00 $28.00
8" WOOD PEGS (PER 1000) No Bid 6" wood pegs $64.00 $66.00| per 750

TERMS / COMMENTS:

1% 10 days, Net 30 days.

Prices will remain firm for 90 days.
After 90 days prices will be reviewed
for possible increase or decrease
relative to current market conditions.

1% 10 days, Net 30

2% 10 days, Net 30

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Scott Peterson, Road Superintendent at 616-527-1700 x 108 or scott@ioniacountyroads.org




SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2010 @ 1:00 P.M.

TABULATION
ITEM IX
DIESEL
ULTRA BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
LOW SULFUR
WINTER BLEND Scotland Oil Petroleum Traders Petersen QOil Tri Lakes Petroleum Brenner Oil Lemmen Oil RKA Petroleum
Rack Price| $ 1.9400 | $ 2.0910 | $ 1.9850 | $ 1.9500 | $ 2.0406 | $ 1.9703 | $ 2.0069
Freight| $ 0.0320 | $ 0.0325 | $ 0.0250 | $ 0.0240 | $ 0.0225 | $ 0.0260 | $ 0.0561
% Over Rack Price| $ 0.0150 | $ 0.0540 | $ 0.0150 | $ 0.0200 | $ 0.0100 | $ - $ -
Total Price per Gallon| $ 1.9870 | $ 21775 | $ 2.0250 | $ 1.9940 | $ 20731 | $ 1.9963 | $ 2.0630
REGULAR BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
LOW SULFUR
SUMMER BLEND Scotland QOil Petroleum Traders Petersen Oil Tri Lakes Petroleum Brenner Qil Lemmen QIl RKA Petroleum
Rack Price| $ 1.9400 | $ 2.0910 | $ 1.9850 N/A $ 2.0406 | $ 1.9603 [ $ 2.0069
Freight| $ 0.0320 | $ 0.0325 | $ 0.0250 $ 0.0225 | $ 0.0260 | $ 0.0411
% Over Rack Price| $ 0.0050 | $ 0.0340 | $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total Price per Gallon| $ 1.9770 | $ 2.1575 | $ 2.0100 $ 2.0631 | $ 1.9863 | $ 2.0480
Price Held/Not Held Price not held Price not held Price not held Price not held Price not held Price not held Price not held
Notes:|Net 4 days Net 30 days Net 10 days 10 days from date  |Net 10 Net 10 Net 10
Total shown on bid sheet of lift Net 30 available
$1.997 for winter blend for .01 more
$1.98 for summer blend per gallon

Questions regarding this tabulation may be directed to Don Chubb, Fleet Manager at 616-527-1700 x 118 or don@ioniacountyroads.org
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