SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY JANUARY 3, 2018 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION
lonia County Road Commission Rocal, Inc. Dornbos Sign Inc.  |Osborn Associates, Inc.| MD Solutuions Vulcan Signs Michigan State Indust
SIGNS DESCRIPTION Frankfort, OH Charlotte, Ml Logan, OH Plain City, OH Foley, AL Lansing, MI
36" STOP HIP New $40.43 $31.85 $34.56 $38.25 $32.06 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $14.30 $34.56 $38.25 no bid $25.20
Aluminum Blank $27.00 $19.54 $19.26 $18.99 $19.46 no bid
36" STOP AHEAD HIP New $45.43 $36.80 $34.56 $38.25 $34.98 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $19.25 $34.56 $38.25 no bid $25.20
Aluminum Blank $27.00 $21.15 $19.26 $18.99 $21.51 no bid
36" YIELD HIP New $22.57 $16.69 $17.28 $22.00 $15.01 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $7.92 $17.28 $22.00 no bid $25.20
Aluminum Blank $15.50 $10.57 $9.63 $12.00 $9.74 no bid
30" STOP HIP New $25.90 $22.15 $21.98 $26.56 $22.11 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $10.90 $21.98 $26.56 no bid $17.50
Aluminum Blank $18.75 $13.60 $13.38 $13.19 $13.36 no bid
30" STOP AHEAD HIP New $30.90 $25.60 $23.97 $26.56 $24.36 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $13.42 $23.97 $26.56 no bid $17.50
Aluminum Blank $18.75 $14.68 $13.38 $13.19 S14.74 no bid
30X30 WARNING HIP New $36.63 $23.18 $23.97 $26.56 $23.00 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $11.00 $23.97 $26.56 no bid $17.50
Aluminum Blank $18.75 $14.68 $13.38 $13.19 S14.74 no bid
36X36 WARNING HIP New $54.18 $33.39 $34.56 $38.25 $33.12 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $15.84 $34.56 $38.25 no bid $25.20
Aluminum Blank $27.00 $21.15 $19.26 $18.99 $20.52 no bid
18X18 WARNING HIP New $13.55 $8.34 $8.64 $9.56 $8.65 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $3.96 $8.64 $9.56 no bid $6.30
Aluminum Blank $6.75 $5.28 $4.82 $4.75 $5.50 no bid
24X18 WARNING HIP New $18.06 $11.13 $11.52 $12.75 $11.04 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $5.28 $11.52 $12.75 no bid $8.40
Aluminum Blank $9.00 $7.05 $6.42 $6.37 $6.84 no bid
24X24 WARNING HIP New $24.08 $14.84 $15.36 $17.00 $14.72 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $7.04 $15.36 $17.00 no bid $11.20
Aluminum Blank $12.00 $9.40 $8.56 $8.44 $9.12 no bid
48X24 WARNING HIP New $48.16 $29.68 $30.72 $34.00 $29.44 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $14.08 $30.72 $34.00 no bid $22.40
Aluminum Blank $24.00 $18.80 $17.12 $16.88 $18.24 no bid
12X18 REGULATORY [HIP New $6.77 $5.56 $5.76 $6.38 $5.80 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $2.64 $5.76 $6.38 no bid $4.20
Aluminum Blank $4.50 $3.52 $3.21 $3.17 $3.69 no bid
24X30 REGULATORY [HIP New $22.85 $18.55 $19.20 $21.40 $18.40 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $8.80 $19.20 $21.40 no bid $14.00
Aluminum Blank $15.00 $11.75 $10.70 $10.55 $11.40 no bid




SIGNS DESCRIPTION Rocal, Inc. Dornbos Sign Inc.  |Osborn Associates, Inc. MD Solutions Vulcan Signs Michigan State Indust
30X30 REGULATORY |HIP New $28.57 $23.18 $34.56 $26.56 $23.00 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $11.00 $34.56 $26.56 no bid $17.50
Aluminum Blank $18.75 $14.68 $13.38 $13.19 $14.74 no bid
30X36 REGULATORY |[HIP New $43.33 $33.39 $28.80 $31.88 $27.60 no bid
HIP Refurb no bid $18.77 $28.80 $31.88 no bid $21.00
Aluminum Blank $22.50 $17.62 $16.05 $15.83 $17.10 no bid
REFL ROLLED GOODS 36'x50 yards
Black $463.50| vinyl $544.50/EC $508.50 $423.00 $595.00| 3M 3650-12 $534.26 no bid
Colored $580.50 $580.50 $526.50 $625.00 $543.12 no bid
STREET SIGN EXTRUDED/FLAT PANEL HIP 9" x 9" x 9" x 9" x Single sided no msg: 9" x 9" x
18" $8.13 $4.15 $8.71 $7.31 $4.57 no bid
24" $10.85 $5.56 $11.67 $9.38 $5.91 no bid
30" $13.56 $6.93 $14.59 $11.72 $7.27 no bid
36" $16.27 $8.34 $17.51 $14.06 $8.71 no bid
48" $21.69 $11.13 $23.34 $18.75 $11.60 no bid
48X9 RR CROSS BUCKS| $19.71 or $39.42 set $49.55 $78.78 $54.00 $42.60 no bid
4x8 HIP rectangular panel (ea) $2.73 $2.85 $2.05 $1.50 $1.95 no bid
7' painted steel delineator post (ea) no bid $5.45 $11.06 $6.13 $7.40%* no bid
Galvanized sign backing plate (ea) no bid $0.59 $1.25 $1.25 $1.95%* no bid
12 ga. Square tubing 3' length (ea) no bid $10.50 $10.14 $10.50 $8.51* no bid
Terms / Comments: Signs must be ordered in  |Net 30 days Minimum order 51,000 |Signs are quoted as standard |Net 30 days.
quantities of 6 or more or freight additional. MUTCD one-color messages |40 cents per Ib. credit

of the same legend.
Refurbished signs must

be clean, dry and flat.
Minimum order 51,500.00

except for the stop-ahead
symbols. *Posts must be
ordered in bundles of 25.
**Galvanized backing plates
quoted as 3"x3" sign savers.
Stock items ship in 3-5 days
ARO. Non-stock items ship
in 30-45 days ARO.

for signs turned in.




