IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY JANUARY 3, 2018 @ 1:00 PM
TABULATION

PLASTIC PIPE

Advanced Drainage Systems

Etna Supply

Core and Main

M292 Type S Smooth Int.

*Single Wall Corr.

M292 Type S Smooth Int.

Single Wall Corr.

M292 Type S Smooth Int.

Single Wall Corr.

DIAMETER| PRICE PER | DIAMETER |PRICE PER| DIAMETER| PRICE PER | DIAMETER [PRICE PER| DIAMETER| PRICE PER | DIAMETER|[PRICE PER
INCHES FOOT INCHES | FOOT | INCHES FOOT INCHES | FOOT | INCHES FOOT INCHES | FOOT
4 $0.90 4 $0.43 4 $0.90 4 $0.43 4 $0.90 4 $0.43
6 $1.84 6 $0.95 6 $1.84 6 $0.95 6 $1.84 6 $0.95
8 $3.00 8 $1.67 8 $3.00 8 $1.67 8 $3.00 8 $1.67
10 $4.05 10 $4.47 10 $4.05 10 $4.47 10 $4.05 10 $4.47
12 $4.74 12 $5.26 12 $4.74 12 $5.26 12 $4.74 12 $5.26
15 $6.58 15| no bid 15 $6.58 15| no bid 15 $6.58 15| no bid
18 $8.69 18| no bid 18 $8.69 18| no bid 18 $8.69 18| no bid
24 $13.69 24| no bid 24 $13.69 24| no bid 24 $13.69 24| no bid
30 $20.00 30/ no bid 30 $20.00 30| no bid 30 $20.00 30| no bid
36 $25.26 36| no bid 36 $25.26 36| no bid 36 $25.26 36| no bid
42 $40.00 42| no bid 42 $40.00 42| no bid 42 $40.00 42| no bid
48 $44.25 48| no bid 48 $44.25 48| no bid 48 $44.25 48| no bid
60 $71.60 60|  no bid 60 $71.60 60|  no bid 60 $71.60 60|  no bid

Terms / Comments:

*price w/out sock

Terms / Comments:

Terms / Comments:




