IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEASONAL BIDS - WEDNESDAY JANUARY 3, 2018 @ 1:00 PM

TABULATION

NUTS, BOLTS, MISC. HARDWARE

Alma Bolt Company Blue Water Industrial Winter Equipment Co.

Price per Delivery Price per Delivery Price per Delivery
Quantity Time Quantity Time Quantity Time

2000 5/8 - 11 x 2 1/2 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT $970.00| Immediate |$1,040.00 2 - 3days $1,526.00

2000 5/8 - 11 X 2 3/4 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT $1,000.00| Immediate |$1,120.00 2 -3 days no bid

2000 5/8 - 11 X 2 1/4 GRADE 8 PLOW BOLT $890.00| Immediate $980.00| 2-3days [$1,420.00

2000 5/8 HEAVY SPLIT LOCK WASHER $169.00| Immediate $160.00 2 - 3days $260.00

2000 5/8 - 11 HEAVY HEX NUT 2 HARD $380.60| Immediate $640.00 2 - 3days $820.00

100 3/8 - 16 X 1 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $11.50| Immediate $12.00| 2-3days no bid

100 1/2 - 13 X 2 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $35.15| Immediate $36.00| 2 -3days no bid

100 1/4 - 20 X 1 1/2 HEX HEAD CAP SCREW $5.90 Immediate $10.00| 2-3days no bid

100 3/8 FLAT WASHERS HEAVY DUTY $3.21| Immediate $6.00[ 2-3days no bid

100 1/2 FLAT WASHERS HEAVY DUTY $6.80| Immediate $15.00 2 - 3days $22.00

100 1/2 FLAT FENDER WASHERS $5.98 [ Immediate $5.50( 2-3days no bid

100 3/16 X 12" PLASTIC TIE WRAPS $4.87 | Immediate $10.00| 2-3days no bid

100' 12 X 2 GAUGE ELECTRICAL WIRE no bid| Immediate $73.29| 2-3days no bid

100' 12 GAUGE ELECTRICAL WIRE $22.20*| Immediate $40.28| 2-3days no bid

TERMS / COMMENTS|Net 30 days 1% 10; net 30 Net 30

*price per roll-all colors




