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IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
GRAVEL BID TABULATION SUMMARY
AND AWARD RECOMMENDATION FOR 2017

The Board reviewed the bid tabulation by township for Contract #17-12 Gravel Resurfacing. On March 22,
2017, at the regular meeting of the Board of Road Commissioners for lonia County, per the attached
tabulation sheet, a motion was made by Ken Gasper and seconded by Albert Almy to award the bids by
township to the contractor(s) whose bid was in the best interest of the county and as selected by each
township. The ultimate decision rests with each of the respective townships and final results are pending
the receipt of approved township contracts. Motion carried.

www.ioniacountyroads.org



IONIA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

Wednesday, March 15, 2017 @ 2:00 p.m.

Tabulation

2017 Gravel Resurfacing of roads in lonia County

Load, Haul and Place from Reynolds Pit

BIDDER: Rusche's Trucking Yellow Rose Transport | Fisher Transportation | Stoneco of Michigan Carrick Trucking L & D Carey & Sons CL Trucking
Location Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Portland Rd No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $7.24 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.52 Reynolds $5.35 Reynolds $7.38 Reynolds
Hastings Rd No Bid Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $7.36 Reynolds No Bid Reynolds $5.52 Reynolds $5.35 Reynolds $7.38 Reynolds
Furnish, Load, Haul and Place 23A

BIDDER: Rusche's Trucking Yellow Rose Transport | Fisher Transportation | Stoneco of Michigan Carrick Trucking L & D Carey & Sons CL Trucking
TOWNSHIP | Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin $16.00 [Lowell Pit $11.65 $12.09  [Shroufe $17.88 |Patterson $10.30 |Hewitt $11.10 [Shroufe $11.60 |Lyons Stone
Boston $15.50 [Lowell Pit $11.90 $13.99 [Shroufe $16.53 |Patterson $10.30 |Hewitt $11.50 |Hasting $13.75 |Lyons Stone
Campbell No Bid $13.35 $12.04 [Hubble $16.05 |Patterson $10.20 [Hewitt $10.85 |Hasting $13.75 |Shroufe
Danby No Bid $13.50 $12.01  [Shroufe $20.83 |Patterson $10.98 |Schafer/Wolt $11.10 [Shroufe $11.70 |Lyons Stone
Easton $16.50 |Lowell Pit $12.25 $12.13  [Shroufe $19.56 |Patterson $9.37 |Hewitt/Wolth $11.15 |Shroufe $10.92 |Kiefer

lonia No Bid $11.75 $11.12 [Shroufe $19.43 |Patterson $7.50 |Wolthuis $11.25 |Shroufe $9.70 |Kiefer/Stny Crk
Keene $16.00 |Whites Bridge $13.40 $13.49 [Shroufe $18.29 |Patterson $10.15 |Hewitt/Wolth $12.17 |Shroufe $12.70 |Kiefer
Lyons No Bid $12.00 $11.03 [Shroufe $21.57 |Patterson $7.45 [Schafer/Wolt $10.00 |Woods $9.70 |Lyons/StnyCrk
N. Plains No Bid $12.25 $10.97 |[Wood $23.60 |Patterson $7.41 [Schafer/Wolt $9.65 |[Woods $9.70 |Kiefer/Stny Crk
Odessa No Bid $12.50 $12.80 [Hubble $17.84 |Patterson $10.25 [Hewitt $10.95 |Hasting $13.75 |Shroufe
Orange No Bid $11.50 $11.25 [Shroufe $18.75 |Patterson $10.00 |Hewitt/Schafe $9.73 |Shroufe $10.70 |Lyons Stone
Orleans No Bid $13.00 $12.79 [Wood $20.33 |Patterson $9.70 |Wolthuis $10.80 |Woods $10.92 |Kiefer
Otisco $18.00 |Whites Bridge $14.65 $13.99 [Shroufe $19.61 |Patterson $10.23 |Schafer/Wolt $11.75 |Woods $12.96 |Kiefer
Portland No Bid $12.50 $11.03  [Shroufe $20.24 |Patterson $8.20 |Schafer/Wolt $9.47 |Shroufe $9.86 |Lyons Stone
Ronald No Bid $12.50 $11.92 [Shroufe $21.59 |Patterson $8.18 |Schafer/Wolt $9.95 |Woods $9.86 |Kiefer
Sebewa No Bid $13.50 $12.13  [Shroufe $19.67 |Patterson $10.25 |Hewitt/Schafe $11.10 [Shroufe $11.70 |Lyons Stone
Furnish, Load, Haul and Place 22A Modified

BIDDER: Rusche's Trucking Yellow Rose Transport | Fisher Transportation | Stoneco of Michigan Carrick Trucking L & D Carey & Sons CL Trucking
TOWNSHIP | Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source Unit Price Source
Berlin $16.00 [Lowell Pit No Bid No Bid $17.88 |Patterson $10.30 |Hewitt $11.10 [Shroufe $11.60 |Lyons Stone
Boston $15.50 [Lowell Pit No Bid No Bid $16.53 |Patterson $10.30 |Hewitt $11.50 |Hasting $13.75 |Lyons Stone
Campbell No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.05 |Patterson $10.20 [Hewitt $10.85 |Hasting $13.75 |Shroufe
Danby No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.83 |Patterson $10.98 |Schafer/Wolt $11.10 [Shroufe $11.70 |Lyons Stone
Easton $16.50 |Lowell Pit No Bid No Bid $19.56 |Patterson $9.37 |Hewitt/Wolth $11.15 |Shroufe $10.92 |Kiefer

lonia No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.43 |Patterson $7.50 |Wolthuis $11.25 |Shroufe $9.70 |Kiefer/Stny Crk
Keene $16.00 |Whites Bridge No Bid No Bid $18.29 |Patterson $10.15 |Hewitt/Wolth $12.17 |Shroufe $12.70 |Kiefer
Lyons No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.57 |Patterson $7.45 [Schafer/Wolt $10.00 |Woods $9.70 |Lyons/StnyCrk
N. Plains No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.60 |Patterson $7.41 [Schafer/Wolt $9.65 |[Woods $9.70 |Kiefer/Stny Crk
Odessa No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.84 |Patterson $10.25 |Hewitt $10.95 |Hasting $13.75 |Shroufe
Orange No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.75 |Patterson $10.00 |Hewitt/Schafe $9.73 |Shroufe $10.70 |Lyons Stone
Orleans No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.33 |Patterson $9.70 |Wolthuis $10.80 |Woods $10.92 |Kiefer
Otisco $18.00 |Whites Bridge No Bid No Bid $19.61 |Patterson $10.23 |Schafer/Wolt $11.75 |Woods $12.96 |Kiefer
Portland No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.24 |Patterson $8.20 |Schafer/Wolt $9.47 |Shroufe $9.86 |Lyons Stone
Ronald No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.59 |Patterson $8.18 |Schafer/Wolt $9.95 |Woods $9.86 |Kiefer
Sebewa No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.67 |Patterson $10.25 |Hewitt/Schafe $11.10 [Shroufe $11.70 |Lyons Stone
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